REGULAR COUNCIL MEETING
OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF BROOK PARK, OHIO
TO BE HELLD ON TUESDAY, DECEMBER 5, 2017
7:30 P.M.

ROLL CALL OF MEMBERS

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

APPROVAL OF MINUTES OF PRECEDING MEETINGS:
1. CAUCUS PRICR TO MEETING HELD ON NOVEMBER 21, 2017.

2. REGULAR COUNCIL MEETING HELD ON NOVEMBER 21, 2017. .

REPORTS OF STANDING COMMITTEES:
AVIATION & ENVIRONMENTAL (Powers)
FINANCE COMMITTEE (McDonnell)
LEGISLATIVE COMMITTEE - (Troyer)

PARKS & RECREATION COMMITTEE (Mencini)
PLANNING COMMITTEE - (Troyer)

SAFETY COMMITTEE - (Salvatore)

SERVICE COMMITTEE - (Burgio)

BOARD OF ZONING APPEALS - (Scott)

REPORTS OF SPECIAL COMMITTEES:
SOUTHWEST GENERAL HEALTH CENTER - TRUSTEE (Salvatore)
BEREA BOARD OF EDUCATION COMMITTEE (Burgio)

REPORTS OF BOARDS AND COMMISSIONS:

INTRODUCTION OF RESOLUTIONS OF COMMENDATION:

REPORTS AND COMMUNICATIONS FROM THE MAYOR:




REGULAR COUNCIL MEETING DECEMBER 5, 2017

1. REPORTS AND COMMUNICATIONS FROM DEPARTMENTS, COMMISSIONS,
AND OTHER PUBLIC OFFICIALS:

J. OTHER COMMUNICATIONS AND PETITIONS, AND VERBAL APPROVAL.:
(INTRODUCTION OF NEW LEGISLATION):

OTHER COMMUNICATIONS:
Veto of the Mayor:

1.

RESOLUTION NO. 27-2017, TO EXTEND THE MORATORIUM ON THE GRANTING
OF BUILDING PERMITS OR CERTIFICATES OF OCCUPANCY FOR ANY BUILDING,
STRUCTURE, USE OR CHANGE OF USE THAT WOULD ENABLE THE CULTIVATION,
PROCESSING OR RETAIL SALE OF MEDICAL MARIJUANA FOR A PERIOD NOT TO
EXCEED SIX MONTHS FROM THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF THIS RESOLUTION, IN
ORDER TO ALLOW THE CITY ADMINISTRATION, COUNCIL AND THE BROOK PARK
PLANNING COMMISSION TO REVIEW APPLICABLE OHIO STATUTES, CRIMINAL
CODES AND THE BROOK PARK ZONING CODE RELATIVE TO SUCH USE AND
DECLARING AN EMERGENCY Introduced by Councilman Scott, Burgio, Salvatore,
Troyer, Powers, McDonnell, Mencini and Council President Astorino.

Note: Per Section 3.03 (b) of the City Charter this legislation must

be reconsidered by Council.

K. MISCELLANEOUS BUSINESS, APPOINTMENTS, CONFIRMATIONS:

L. REMARKS FROM THE AUDIENCE ON ANY SUBJECT MATTER:

M. INTRODUCTION OF ORDINANCES AND RESOLUTIONS: (FIRST READING):

1.

ORDINANCE NO. 11008-2017, AMENDING ORDINANCE NO. 10070-2017, THE
APPROPRIATION ORDINANCE FOR THE CITY OF BROOK PARK AND
DECLARING AN EMERGENCY. Introduced by Mayor Coyne

ORDINANCE NO. 11009-2017, TO PROVIDE FOR THE TEMPORARY
APPROPRIATIONS OF THE CITY OF BROOK PARK, STATE OF OHIO, FOR
THE THREE MONTHS ENDING ON MARCH 31, 2018 AND DECLARING AN
EMERGENCY. Introduced by Mayor Coyne

ORDINANCE NO. 11010-2017, AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO ENTER INTO

AN AGREEMENT WITH GREATER CLEVELAND AUTO AUCTION, PUBLIC

AUCTIONEERS, FOR THE PURPOSE OF DISPOSING OF OBSOLETE CITY

VEHICLES AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY. Introduced by Mayor Coyne
2




REGULAR COUNCIL MEETING DECEMBER 5, 2017

M.

INTRODUCTION OF ORDINANCES AND RESOLUTIONS: (FIRST READING):
CONT:

4,

ORDINANCE NO. 11011-2017, TO ENTER INTO A CONTRACT WITH B & BF
CONTRUCTION TO COMPLETE SANITARY SEWER REPAIRS NEAR 21718
FORESTVIEW CIRCLE AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY. Introduced by
Mayor Coyne

RESOLUTION NO. 28-2017, DESIGNATING THE MONTH OF OCTOBER AS
BREAST CANCER AWARENESS MONTH IN THE CITY OF BROOK PARK, OHIO
AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY. Introduced by Councilmembers Troyer,
Mencini, Powers and Council President Astorino

RESOLUTION NO. 25-2017, RECOGNIZING PROJECT EVERGREEN'S GREENCARE
AND SNOWCARE FOR TROOPS INITIATIVE AS THE PREFERRED PROVIDER FOR
FAMILIES OF DEPLOYED MILITARY PERSONNEL AND POST 9/11/ DISABLED
VETERANS WITH A SERVICE-CONNECTED DISABILITY IN THE CITY OF BROOK
PARK AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY, Introduced by Mayor Coyne

RESOLUTION NO. 30-2017, HONORING ASTRONAUT AND SENATOR, JOHN
GLENN AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY. Introduced by Councilman Troyer

SECOND READING OF ORDINANCES AND RESOLUTIONS:

1.

ORDINANCE NO. 11007-2017, REQUESTING CERTIFICATION TO ENFORCE
THE 2017 OHIO STATE BUILDING CODES WITHIN THE CITY OF BROOK PARK
AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY. Introduced by Mayor Coyne

THIRD READING OF ORDINANCES AND RESOLUTIONS:

ADJOURNMENT:




SYNOPSIS OF ORDINANCES AND RESOLUTIONS
FOR THE COUNCIL MEETING OF DECEMBER 5, 2017

FIRST READING:

ORDINANCES :
Ord. No.11008-2017

Ord. No. 11009-2017

Ord. No. 11010-2017

Ord. No.11011-2017

RESCOLUTIONS:
Resolution 28-2017

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CRDINANCE NO. 10070-2017 THE
APPROPRIATION ORDINANCE FOR THE CITY OF BROOK PARK, AND
DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

SYNOPSIS: An ordinance adjusting the appropriation
ordinance for Z017.

AN ORDINANCE TO PROVIDE FOR THE 2018 TEMPORARY
APPROPRIATIONS FOR THE CITY OF BROOK PARK FOR THE THREE
MONTHS ENDING MARCH 31, 2018, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

SYNOPSIS: An ordinance to provide the 2018 temporary
budget for the City of Brock Park.

AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING AND APPROVING THE MAYOR TO ENTER
INTO AN AGREEMENT WITH GREATER CLEVELAND AUTC AUCTION,
PUBLIC AUCTIONEERS, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

SYNOPSIS: An ordinance to allow Greater Cleveland Auto
Aucticn to dispose of obsolete city vehicles.

AN ORDINIANCE AUTHORIZING AND APPROVING B & 3BF
CONSTRUCTION TO CCMPLETE SANITARY SEWER REPAIRS NEAR
21718 FORESTVIEW CIRCLE, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

SYNOPSIS: An ordinance te authorize B & BF Construction
to repair an existing 127 sanitary sewer and authorize
the Mayor to pay for said repair work for an estimated
$19,600.00.

(as corrected) A RESOLUTION DESIGNATING THE MONTH OF
OCTORER AS BREAST CANCER AWARENESS MONTE IN THE CITY OF
BROOK FARK, OHIO, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

SYNCPSIS: A resolution to declare each October in Brook
Park Breast Cancer Awareness month. Each June council
will discuss at a caucus meeting how they will show
support each October. The city will show its support by
lighting up our gazebo with pink lights each October.
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SECOND READING:
Ord. 11007-2017

A RESOLUTION RECOGNIZING PROJECT EVERGREEN’'S GREENCARE
AND SNOWCARE FOR TROOPS INITIATIVE AS THE FPREFERRED
PROVIDER FOR FAMILIES OF DEPLOYED MILITARY PERSONNEL,,
AND POST 9/11 DISABLED VETERANS WITH A SERVICE-CONNECTED
DISABILITY IN THE CITY OF BRCOK PARK, AND DECLARING AN
EMERGENCY.

SYNOPSIS: The City of Brook Park reccognizes PRCJECT
EVERGREEN’ S GREENCARE AND SNOWCARE FOR TRCOOPS INITIATIVE
as the preferred provider for families of deployed
military and post 9/11 veterans and urges families of
such to sign up for this service.

A RESCLUTICN HONORING ASTRONAUT AND SENATOR, JOEN GLENN,
AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

SYNQOPSIS: Honoring Senatcr John Glenn for his
accomplishments, vyears of service and creation of the
John Glenn Institute for Pubklic Service at Ohlo State.

AN ORDINANCE REQUESTING CERTIFICATION TO ENFORCE THE 2017
CHIO STATE BUILPING CODES WITHIN THE CITY OF BROOK PARK,
AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

SYNOPSIS: An ordinance to adopt and enforce the Ohio
State Buillding Ccdes, the 2017 COhio Mechanical Cecde, 2017
naticnal Electric Code and the 2012 International Energy
code to provide for uniform standards and reguirements.

PREPARED BY THE BROCK PARK LEGAL DEPARTMENT

NOVEMBER 30, 2017




Memo

Date: November 22, 2017

To:  Clerk of Council, M1ch ¢
City Council

Blazak, President of City Council, Jim Astorino, All members of

From: Mayor Tom Coyneg”

RE:  Resolution 274201

Please be advised that in accordance with section 3.03(b) of the Charter of the City of Brook Park, I
hereby Veto Resolution 27- 2017 for the following reasons;

1. After review of the state regulations retail sales would be the only portion of the
operation of the medical marijuana processing that could be considered in Brook Park. Ideally, it
was my hope that retail sales could be undertaken by licensed pharmacies, the state determined
otherwise. [ see no impediments nor adverse effects to retail sales outlets being permitted in our
city. This resolution speaks more to procrastination then legitimate concern. Council should enact
legislation to allow for retail sales outlets under a conditional use permit. The continuation of the
moratoriums serves no legitimate purpose.

2. Concern for our veterans and convenience of accessibility to prescribed treatment for our citizens
should be paramount. The medical advocates contend that medical marijuana is the better choice
than opioids to treat pain and relieve suffering. Our affected citizens should not have to leave
Brook Park to get the prescribed help they require.

3. It's Veterans Day, banks are closed, people don't receive their mail and military veterans have
multiple opiions to eat free at restaurants as a thank you for their services. But the American
Legion, wants those who served to have access to something else: medical marijuana. The National
American Legion wants the federal government to reclassify marijuana and to allow veteran
affairs doctors to prescribe medical marijuana to patients in states that allow it. Brook Park City
Council should pass a resolution to that effect supporting our veterans.

4. Finally, as of September 2018 physicians in Ohio will now be allowed to prescribe medical
mari Cguana to their patients suffering from any disease on the following list:

282 27 i LAY




» AIDS/HIV » Multiple sclerosis

¢ Alzheimer's disease « Chronic or severe pain

» Amyotrophic lateral sclerosis, or ALS « Parkinson's disease

» Cancer s Post-traumatic stress disorder, or PTSD
« Chronic traumatic encephalopathy + Sickle cell anemia

« Epilepsy or another seizure disorder » Spinal cord disease or injury

« Fibromyalgia » Tourette's syndrome

* Glaucoma e Traumatic brain injury, or TBI

« Hepatitis C » Ulcerative colitis

o Inflammatory bowel disease

We have hundreds of veterans and other citizens in our city suffering from one or more of the above
diseases. If their doctor does prescribe these medicines to eliminate their pain our citizens should not
have to go to other cities just to fill thejr prescriptions.
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INTRODUGED BY Mayor Cayne éﬂﬁ ﬁ ]

ey |

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ORDINANCE NO. 10070-2017 , THE 3rd ’
APPROPRIATION ORZINANCE FOR THE CITY OF BRCOX PARK, AND DECLARING q/C
AN EMERGENCY. (AT

WHEREAS, the amounts appropriated for certain items of expense for 2017 are proving to be
insufficient while surphises are developing in certain other appropriations.

NOW, THEREFORE, be it ordained hy the Counci of the City of Brook Park, Chio;

SECTION 1: That Ordinance No. 10070-2017, passed March 28, 2017, the Appropriation
Ordinange for the City of Brook Park, be amended to reflect the following adjustments:

100 GENERAL FUND

411 Clerk of Council 513 Part-Time Salaries 20,580.42 5,000.00 25,580,42
&9 Fringe Benefits 17.980.83 T72.50 18,753.43
210 Mayor's Court ' 513 Part-Time Safares 62,452,78 4,200.00 66,6562.78
519 Fringe Benefits 27,080.66 648,80 27,729.58
528 Office Supplies 1,938.22 £00.00 2,538.22
320 Planning Commission 511 Commission Salaries 5,000.00 {400.00) 5,800.00
519 Fringe Benefits 827.00 {SA.70} 834.30
335 Board of Zoning Appeals 511 Commissicn Salaries 6,000.00 400.00 5,400.00
5o Fringe Benefits ©E2TO0 9270 1,019.70
342 Parks & Playarounds 512 Overtime 180,00 750.00 810.00
519 Fringe Beneitts 47,456.86 115.88 4757274
343 Fublic Recreation 513 Part-Time Salaries 20,200.00 4,000.00 24,200.00
519 Fringe Benefils 3,120,980 518.00 3,738.90
§23 Professional Services 38,180.13 {10,000.00) 28,190.13
345 Home Days Celebration 511 Regular Salaries 1,000.00 341.75 1,341.75
512 COvertime 12,300.00 3,300.35 15,600.35
519 Fringe Benefits 332.85 1.390.53 1,723.38
522 Equipment Rental 1,500.00 (300.00} 1,200.00
523 Professicnal Services 42,500.00 (3,500.00) 38,600.00
524 Repair & Maintenance 1,500.00 (r85.92) 714.08
528 Tools & Minor Equipment 100.00 (50.02) 49.93
400 Mayor's Office 513 Part-Time Salaries 21,528,00 4,000.00 25,528.00
519 Fringe Benefils 48,671.35 618.60 50,289.35
521 Communications 5,300.00 1,000.00 6,300.00
525 Travel & Education 3,060.37 400.00 3,480.37
526 Office Supplies 4,803.13 1,000,00 5,803.13
527 Miscellaneous Expenses 2,398.96 3,000.00 5,398.98
402 Human Resources 523" Professional Services 3,018.00 2,050.00 5,068.00
405 Gorrectional Facility 529 Contracts 16,751.02 8,000.00 24,751.02
407 Safely Town 523 Professicnal Services 2,450.00 400.00 2,850.00
524 Repair & Maint_enance 0.00 210.62 210.62
409 Mechanics 511 Regular Salaries 426,378.80 6,000.00 432,378.80
512 Overtime 2,850.00 1,000.00 3,650.00
519 Fringe Benefits 146,495.37 1,081.50 147,576.87
411 Safety Building 529 Confracts 421,023.80 23,645.08 444 668.75
412 Pelice Department 511 Regular Salarfes 3,239,882 87 40,000.00 3,279,882.87
512 Overlime 226,000.00 20,000.00 245,000.00
518 Fringe Benefits 546,727.86 870.00 547 597.86
413 Fire Department 511 Regular Salaries 2,594,528.4¢ 41,000.00 2,845,528.49
512 Overtime 382,862.55 54,000.00 416,862.55
519 Fringe Benefits 4£40,972.50 1,7232.60 442,205.00
529 Coniracts 57,902,09 12,800.00 70,702.09
414 Disaster Service 527 Miscellaneous Expenses 4,800.00 1,000.00 §,800.00
415 Building Departrment 511 Regular Salaries 341,185.74 4,000.00 345,186.74

§19 Fringe Benefits 104,881.26 618,00 105,488.26




419 Animal Warden

422 Service Building
423 Sanitation
424 Sireet Cleaning

426 Traffic Signs

427 Trees & Tree Lawns

428 Public Properfies

428 Sewers & Drains

432 Snow Removal

500 Law Department

810 Finance Department

841 Qffice of Aging

850 Retirees

830 Elections

831 Auditor & Treasurer Fees
840 Insurance & Bonding

850 Counfy Board of Health

874 Misc. Executive

879 Contingency

880 Transfers & Refunds

210 CITY INCCOME TAX FUND

440 Tax Depariment

240 S.C.M.& R. FUND

425 Street Paving & Repair

241 STATE HIGHWAY IMP. FUND

425 Street Paving & Repair

242 PERMISSIVE TAX FUND

425 Street Paving & Repair

264 WATER PARK FUND

342 Parks & Playgrounds

12
513
519
520
524
27
827
g2y
512
518
524
527
524

512
519

512
518

12
518
827

513
518

518
523

513
518
524
327
518
523
523
527
523

523
529

529

571
574

571

524
553

512
518
524

527
453

513
519
827

Overtime
Part-Time Salarles
Fringe Benefits
Utilities
Repair & Maintenance

Miscellanecus Expenses
Miscellanecus Expenses
Miscellaneous Expenses
Cvertime
Fringe Benefits
Repair & Maintenance
Miscelaneous Expenses

Repair & Maintenance

Cveriime
Fringe Benefits

Cvertime
Fringe Benefits

Overtimsa
Fringe Benefits
Miscellaneous Expenses

Part-Time Salaries
Fringe Benefits

Fringe Benefits
Professional Services

Part-Time Salaries
Fringe Benefits
Repair & Maintenance
Misceflaneous Expenses
Fringe Benefits
Professional Services
Professional Services
Miscellaneous Expenses

Professional Services

Professional Services
Confracts

Contracls

‘Transfers
Refunds

Transfers

Repair & Maintenance
Construction Contracts

Overtime
Fringe Benefits
Repair & Maintenance

Miscellaneous Expenses
Construction Contracts

Part-Time Salaries
Fringe Benefits
Miscellaneous Expenses

2,230.00 2,700.00 4,930.00
23,650.25 2,300.00 25,950.25
16,958.00 772.50 17,730.50

8,077.00 1,000.00 9,077.00

2,207.69 3,000.00 5,207.60
12,089.80 50,000,00 62,099.80

439,062.34 35,000.00 474,062,534
2,050.00 750.00 2,800.00
65000 1,000.00 1,650.00
16,070.48 154.50 16,224.98
2,750.00 250.00 3,000.00
681.03 500.00 1,181.03
4,408.75 10,000.00 14,409.75
950.00 1,500.00 2,450.00
79,242.17 £31.75 79.473.92
42,100.00 12,500.00 54,500.00
137,997.59 1,831.25 139,928.84
51,200.00 15,000.00 66,200.00
7,910.40 2,317.50 10,227.90
229,745.00 (17,317.50) 212,427 50
145,946,35 10,000.00 155,046.35
48,519.58 1,545.00 50,064.58
75,234.60 3,500.00 78,734.60
53,500.00 {3,500.00) 50,000.00
24,800.00 2,500.00 27,300.00

3,831.60 386.25 4,217.85

2,000,060 750.00 2,750.00

1,800.00 500,00 2,300.00

228,000.00 65,000.00 293,000.00
25,000.00 (24,860.03) 139.67
27,500.00 14,108.41 51,508.41

263,859.00 14,358.00 278,217.00
83,453.00 (8,142.00) 75,311.00

149,380.25 $0,000.00 199,380.25

117,584.44 50,000.00 167,584.44

0.00 25,635.83 25,635.83
4,685,000.00 {15,000.00) 4,670,000.00

3,000.00 15,000.00 18,000.00

16,385,671.35 550,000.00 16,035,971.55
18,318,305.94 350,000.00 18,668,305.94
20,165.76 20,000.00 40,165.76
1,096,855.75 (20,000.00) 1.076,855.75
1,117,021.51 0.00 1,117,021.51
0.00 187.19 197.19

0.00 30.47 30.47
14,950.00 50,000.00 4,850.00
14,950.00 50,227.65 €5,177.66
32,500.00 20,000.00 52,500.00

128,075.01 (20,000.00} 108,075.01

160,575.01 ¢.00 160,575.01
37,500.00 1,065.00 38,555.00

5,793.75 163.12 5,956.87

5,324.78 {1,218.12) 4,106.66
48,618.53 0.00 43,616.53




270 LAW ENFORCEMENT FUND

412 Police: Department 525 Travel & Education 0.00 1,400.00 1,500.00
527 Miscellaneous Expenses 2,000.00 1,000.00 3,000.00
852 Equipment 83,000.00 {2,500.00) £0,500.00
85,060.00 0,00 85,000.00
275 CONTINUING TRAINING PROGRAM FUND
412 Police Department 525 Travel & Education 5,500.00 1,000.00 6,500.00
310 GEMERAL BOND RETIREMENT FUND
871 Debt Retirement £61 Principal 485,686.88 120,070.62 B08,759.50
872 Debt Service 523 Professional Services 0.00 161,904.38 161,904.38
5682 Interest 230,732.50 92.315.63 323.048.13
716,421.38 374,290,63 1,080,712.01
401 CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT FUND :
110 Council §52 Equipment 103,274.04 2,262.11 105,536.18
411 Safety Building 551 Land/Building Improvements 248,838.00 (75,000.00} 173,838.00
429 Sewers & Drains 553 Construction Contracts 8,880.34 50,000.00 58,880,34
432 Snow Removal 552 Equipment 97,691.54 8,8686.72 107,258.26
700 General Gov't. Lands & Bldgs. 523 Professional Services 0.00 50,000.00 50,000.00
527 Miscellaneous Expenses 0.00 2,000.00 2,000.00
529 Contracts 50,687.42 1,000.00 51,637.42
552 Equipment 285,214.26 (39,828.83) 245,385.43
794,535,850 0.00 794,535.60
517 SOUND INSULATION FUND
325 Community Development 523 Professional Services $5,559.78 25,000.00 90,559.78
541 W_ 150TH PHASE IV FUND
428 Sewers & Drains 553 Construction Contracts 831,975.03 (254,030.77) 577,944.26
543 2017 STREET [MP. FUND
425 Street Paving & Repair 523 Professiona] Services 331,000.00 10,000.00 341,000.00
553 Construction Contracts 3,294,800.00 (10,000.00) 3,284.800.00
3,625,500.00 0,00 3,525,800.00
544 COMMUNITY CENTER IMP. FUND
700 General Gov't. Lands & Bldgs. 523 Professional Services 220,264.00 (220,264.00) 0.00
711 POLICE PENSION FUND
412 Pelice Department 519 Fringe Benefits 623,362.00 15,000.00 638,362,00
712 FIRE PENSION FUND
413 Fire Department 519 Fringe Benefits £88,442.00 10,000.00 698,442 00
713 8.W.G.H. Fund
851 Hesalih & Welfare 529 Centracts 117,708.81 5,065.24 123,673.85
716 Building Standards Board Fund
415 Building Department 574 Refunds 7.979.49 (2,450.42) §,529.07

Tofal Changes 904,738,34

SECTION 2: Those portions of Ordinance No. 10070-2017, passed March 28, 2017, which are
inconsistent with the provisions adopted herein, are hereby expressly repealed.

SECTION 3: Itis found and determined that all forma! actions of this Council conceming
and relating o the adoption of this Ordinance were adopted in an open meeting of this Gouncll; and that all deliberations
of this Counci and any of iis committees that resulted in formal action were meetings open fo the public in compliance
with all legal requirements including Section 121.22 of the Ohio Revised Code,

SECTION 4: This Ordinance is hereby declared to be an emergency measure immediately
necessary for the preservation of the public peace, health, safety and welfare of the municipality and the inhabitants thereof,
Such emergency existing for the further reascn that funds must be immediately appropriated to the designated accounts o
meet existing financial obligations of the City. Therefore, this Ordinance shall take effect and be in force immediately from
and after its passage and approval by the Mayor.

PASSED:

President of Council

ATTEST: Approved:
Clerk of Coundil Mayor

Date:
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ORDINANCE NO. Z/ 0ﬁ§ ”&j‘/ 7

INTRODUCED BY MAYOR COYNE

AN ORDINANCE TO PROVIDE FOR THE TEMPORARY APPROPRIATIONS OF THE
CITY OF BROUK PARX, STATE OF OHIOQ, FOR. THE THREE MONTHE ENDING ON MARCH 31,

2018, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

WHEREAS, it is necessary for the Council of the City of Brool Park, State of Chia,
to approprime fiunds aynzlable to mect current sxpenses of the said City for a three menth

period ending March 31, 2018,

NOW, THEREFCRE, BE IT CRDABNED by the Council of the City of Brook Pak, Stato of Ohia:

SECTICN 1: That to previde for th

it CRp and other

Ttwres of the

City of Brook Park, Ohio for the firat quarier of the fiscal yeor snding March 31, 2018, thece
be appropriated the total of $17,584,169.81 a5 shown In Secllons 2 thu 10 of this Ordinanca.

SECTION 2: THAT THERE BE APPROPRIATE]? FROM THE GENERAL FUND THE

FOLLOWING AMOUNTS:

31000-3199% 52000-52009 S55000.55595 SE00D-5€959 500057959
COST DPIRSONAL OPERATIONS CAPITAL DIBT TRANSFERS & TOTAL
CNTR DEPARTMENT SERVICES OUTLAY SERVICE REFUNDS APFROPRIATIONS
GENERAL FUND
110 COUNCIL 35,7800 2,250.00 38,03L.00
111 CLERK OF COUNCTL 24,970,00 500,00 25,470.00
210 MAYOR'S COURT 37,531,00 500.00 36,031.00
211 MUNICIPAL COURT 2,00
320  PLANNING COMMISSICN 1,750.00 1L750.00
325  COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT 27,392.00 250.00 27,642.00
330 CIVIL SERVICE COMMISSION 6,029.00 250,00 §270.00
335  BOARD GF ZONING APPEALS 1,750,00 206,00 1,950,00
340 RECREATION COMMISSION 1,750,00 1,750.00
341  RECREATION CENTER 11721500 55,750.00 250,00 173,215,00
342 PARKS & PLAYGROUNDS 3B,650.00  12,250,00 50,900.00
343 PUBLIC RECREATION 9,650,00  11,500.00 21,150,00
345 HOME DAYS CELEBRATION 350,00 350,00
351  CHARTER REVIEW COMMISSION 000
400 MAYOR'S OFFICE 71,150,00 3,800.00 74,950,00
402 HUMAN RESOURCES 24,000,00 4,100.00 28,100,00
405  CORRECTIONAL FACILITY 4050000 11,500.00 52,000.00
407 SAFETY TOWN 000
409 MEGCHANICS 139,500.00 1,500.00 141,000.00
410 SAFETY DIRECTOR 19,750.00 250,00 30,000.00
411 SAFETY BULDING 2895000  145,000.00 173,950,00
412 POLICE DEPARTMENT 87700000  79,500.00 556,500.00
413 FIREDEPARTMENT 34790000 7525000 523,150,00
414  DISASTER SERVICE 25000 4,000.00 4.250.00
415 BUILDENG DEPARIMENT 11025000 3,500.00 250,00 114,000,00
413 SCHOOL GUARDS 19,000.00 15,000.00
419 ANDMAL WARDEN 23,000.00  4,500.00 27,500,00
420 SERVICE DIRECTOR 2975000 2,750,00 12,500,00
421  INGINEERING 12,000.00 12,000,00
422 SERVICE BUILDING 15,500,00  55,000.00 74,500,00
423 SANITATION 114,500.00  B7.500.00 202,000.00
424 STREET CLEANING 20,230,00 300,00 : 20,550,00
426 TRAFFIC SIGNS 17,500.00 250,00 17,750.00
427  TREES & TREE LAWNS 38,750,00 4,000,00 42,750,00
428  FUBLIC PROPERTIES 73,000.00 4,000.00 77,000.00
429  SEWERS & DRAINS 150,750.00  37,000.00 187,750.00
432 SNOW REMOVAL 7500000 150,000.00 225.000.00
' 433 STREET LIGHTING 110,000.00 110,000.00
434 TRAFFIC LIGETS 10,000,080 10,000.00
500  LEGAL DEPARTMENT 61,000.00 500.00 61,500.00
610  FINANCE DEPARTMENT SLY5000  24,500.00 116,250.00
630 TAX REVIEW BOARD ' 0.00
641 OFFICE OF AGING 6,500,00 1,500.00 ' 800000
650  RETIREES 10,000.00 16,000.00
700 GEN. GOV'T, LANDS & BLDGS. 57,500.00 57,500.00
21 RERS. £.00
825 WORKERS' COMPENSATION 350,000.00 ) 350,006.00
826 UNEMPLOYMENTGOMP, " 250,00 B 250,00
830  ELECTIONS 0.00
831  AUDITOR & TREAS, FEES 20,000,00 20,000.00
832 SALE OF DELING. LANDS 0,00
83¢  COLLECTOR FEES 0.00
840  INSURANCE & RONRTNG 600
850  COUNTY BOARD OF HEALTH 48,576.50 9,576.50
874  MISC. EXEQUTIVE 77,500.00 77,500.00
876 CITIZEN OF THE YEAR 0.00
§77  PROPERTY TAX REIMBURSEMENT 0,00
9 CONTINGENCY 0,00
880  TRANSFERS, REFUNDS & OTHER 300,000,00 300,000,00
3,572,218.00 1,110,576.50 0.00 000 30050000  4,983,284.50
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SBCTION 3: THAT THERE BE APPROPRIATED FROM THE SPECIAL REVENUE FUNDS

"THE FOLLOWING AMOUNTS:
51000-5199% 32000-5295% 53000-55939 56000-56959 57000-57999
COST PERSONAL DPERATIONS CATITAL DEBT TRANSERRS & ‘TOTAL
FLRSD CNTR DEPARTMENT SIRVICES QUTLAY SERVICE REFUNDS APPROPRIATICNE
U CITYINCOME TAX FUND
440 TAX DEPARTMENT 250000 39,500,00 410000000 4202,000.00
31 CNTY INGOME TAX OPERATIONAL CASH FUND
40 TAX DEPARTMENT 100,00 100.00
25 ADMISSIONS TAX FUND
440 TAX DEPARTMENT 705000 %0000 9,050.00
230 HOTEL, MOTEL TAX FUND
440 TAX DEPARTMENT 0.0
240 STREET C.M. & REPAIR FUND
#5  STREETPAVING & REPAIR 00000 40,000.00 173,000.00
1 STATEHWY.IMPROVEMENT FUND
425  STREETPAVING & REPATR 33,0000 25,200.00
22 PERMISSIVE TAX FUND ‘
425 STREET PAVING & REPATR 16,000.00 10,000.00
3 ECONOMIC DIVELOPMENT FUND
325 COMMUNITY DEVELGRMENT 15060000 10,000.00 160,000.00
244 BRODKPARK ROAD CORRIDOR FUND
325  COMMUNITY DEVELGPMENT 0.00
45 CDBGFUND
325 COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT v.00
250 SPEGIAL RECREATION FUND
33 PUBLIC RECREATION 12,500.00 12,500.00
3 KENNEDY PARK GONGESSION FUND
342 PARKS & PLAYGROUNDS 2.00
25 CONGESSION PETTY GASH FUND
343 FUBLIC RECREATION 1,480.00 148000
285 REGREATION CENTER CONGESSION FUND
342 PARKS AND PLAYGROUNDS 00
261 HUFSEYIFORBES LONGESSION FUND
342 PARKS & PLAYGROUNDS 000
2% AMERICAN LEGION CONCESSION FUND
M2 PARKS & PLAYGROUNDS a0
63 WEDG PARK CONCESSION FUND
342 PARKS & FLAYGROUNDS, 2.0
264 WATER PARK FUND
347 PARKS & FLAYGROUNDS 1,000.00 1,000,00
25 PLANT LANE CONCESSION FUND
342 PARKS & PLAYGROUNDS o0
6 FURTHERANGE OF JUSTICE FUND
412 POLICE DEPARTMENT 0.00
270 LAW SNFORCEMENT FUND
412 POLICE DEPARTMENT 5,300.00 5,200.00
271 DWI ENFORCEMENT & EDUCATION FUND
412 POLICEDEPARTMENT 500.00 560,80
272 FEDERAL FORFEITURE FUND
412 POLICE DEPARTMENT 10,000,00 10,000.00
23 GOMMUNITY DIVERSION PROGRAM FUND
#Z  POLICE DEPARTMENT 5000 500 100.00
275 CONTINUING TRAINING PROGRAM FUND
412 POLICE DEPARTMENT 1,000.00 1,000.00
280 FEMAFUND
700 GEN, GOV'T. LANDS & BLDGS, 0.00
20 INSURANCE FUND
840 INSURANCE & HONDING 30,000.00 30,000,00
2260000 G000 10,000,00 000 410080000  4850,720.00
SECTION 4: THAT THERE BE APPROPRIATED FROM THE DEET SERVICE LD
THE FOLLOWING AMOUNTS:
51000-51999 5200052552 53000-5599% SC000-36899 S7000-37599
COBT PERSONAL DPERATIONS CAFITAL DEBT TRANSFERS & TO'J"AL
FUND CNTR DEPARTMENT B SERVICES OUTLAY SERVICE REFUNDE APPROPRIATIONS
30 GENERAL BOND RETIREMENT FUND .
71  DEGTRENKEMENT TL,75741 TLISTAL
872 DESTSERVICE 0,00
000 0.00 000 775741 .amw 71,757.41
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SECTION §: THAT THERE EE AFFROFRIATED FROM THE CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
FUND THE FOLLOWING AMOUNTS:

31000-51995 52000.52595 : 55000-55959 5500856553 S00037993
CosT PLRSONAL OPERATIONS CAMTAL DEBT TRANSFERS & TOTAL
FUND QONTR DEPARTMENT SERVICES OUTLAY SERVICE REFUNDS APPROPIIATIONS
401 CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT FUND
110 COUNCIL 103,000,00 103,000.00
210 MAYOR'S COURT
341  RECREATION CENTER ’ 5,000,00 5,000,00
342 PARKS & PLAYGROUNDS 1,000.00 1.000.00
343 PUBLIC RECREATION 0.00
400 MAYOR'S OFFICE 2,000,060 2,000,00
402 HUMAN RESOURCES 0.00
49 MECHANICS 1,500.00 1,500.00
410 SAFETY DIRECTOR 0,00
411 SAFETY BUILDING 110,638.00 . 110,638.00
412 POLICE DERARTMENT 76,000,00 70,008,00
413 FIRE DEPARTMENT 1235,000,00 135,000,00
415 BUILDING DEPARTMENT 250,00 250,00
419 ANIMAL WARDEN e.00
422 SERVICE BUILDING 1,000.00 1,000.00
423 SANJTATION 1,000,600 1,000,00
474 STREET CLEANING . b
425 STREET PAVING & REPAIR . 20,000.00 - 20,000.00
426 TRAFFIC SIGNS 0.00
427  TREES & TREELAWNS 0.00
428 PUBLIC PROPERTIES . 0.00
429 SEWERS & DRATNS 50,000,00 50,000,00
432 SNOW REMOVAI, 55,000.00 55,000,00
453 STREETLIGHTING 0.60
434 TRAFFIC LIGHTS 0.00
440  TAXDEPARTMENT 300,00 500.00
500  LEGAL DEPARTMENT 1,000.00 1,002.00
610  FINANCE DEPARTMENT ' 1,000.00 1,000.00
700 GEN. GOV'T. LANDS & BLDGS. ‘ 175,200.00 175,000,00
880 TRANSFERS & REFUNDS 0,00
0,00 600 73238800 0.00 .00 722,888,00
SECTION & THAT THERE BE APPROPRIATRT FROM THE CAPITAL CONSTRUCTION
FUNDS THE FOLLOWING AMOUNTS:
51000-31999 5200052809 $3000-35930 5600056959 370005793
cosT IERSONAL QPERATIONS CAPITAL ’ DEBT TRANSTERI & ToTaL ’
TUND } CNTR DEPARTMENT SERVICES OUTLAY SERVICE REFUNDS AFPROPRIATIONS
517 $OUND INSULATION PROGRAM FUND
325 COMMUNITY DEVELOBMENT 30,000.00 30,000.00
540 SNOW RD. RESURFAGING FUND
45  STREET PAVING & REPAIR 20,000.00  250,000.00 270,000.00
41 WEST 1507H PHASE IV FUND
: 429 SEWERS & DRAINS 2,500.00 2,500.00
542 2016 STREET IMPROVEMENTS FUND
425  STREETFAVING &REPAIR ' 1,000.00 15,000.00 16,200.00
543 2617 STREET IMPROVEMENTS FUND
425 STREET PAVING & REPAIR 7500000 1,250,000.00 1,325,000.00
s4q COMMUNITY GENTER IMP. FUND
700 GEN. GOV'T, LANDS & ELDGS. 4,500,000,00 4,500,600.00
0.00 128,500,00 6,015,000.00 0,00 0.00 6,143,500,00

SECTION 7: THAT THERE BE APPROPRIATED FROM THE PAYROLL AND PUBLIC
TRUST FUNDS THE FOLLOWING AMOUNTS:

S1000-51882 52000-52953 3300035939 26000-56995 $4000-57993
COsT PERSONAL OPERATIONS CARITAL DEBT TRANSFERS & TOTAL
FUND ENTR DEPARTMENT SERVIGES AUTLAY SERVICE REFUNDS AFFROPIIATIONS
71 POLICE PENSION FUND
412 PGLICE DEPARTMENT 150,000,00 150,000.00
712 FIRE PENSION FUND
. 13  FREDEPARTMENI . e o . L 1B0,000.00 . - 180,500.00
713 SOUTHWEST GENERAL HOSPITAL FUND .
851 HEALTH & WELFARE 20,000.00 20,000,00
714 CASH BONDS HELD FUND
$74  MISC, FXECUTIVE 30,000,60 50,000.00
718 BUILDING STANDARDS BOARD FUND
415 BUILDING DEPARTMENT 1,500.00 1,502.00
mnyr UNGLAIMED MONIES FUND
874  MISC. EXECUTIVE 500,00 500,00
753-777  BAYROLL AGCOUNTS 30,000.00 30,000,090
330,000.00  102,000,00 0.00 0.00 0.00 432,000,00
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SECTION 8: THAT THERE BE APPROPRIATED FROM THE SPECIAL ASSESSMENT BOND

RETIREMENT FUND THE FOLLOWING AMOUNTS:

51000-31999 F2000-52999 35000-53953 2600056999 1700057985
oosT BERSONAL OFERATIONS TAPITAL DEET TRANSFERS & TOTAL
FUND CNTR DEMRTMENT SERVICES OUTLAY SERVICE REFUNDS APPROPIIATIONS
920 SPECIAL ASSESSMENT BOND RET. FUND
871 DEEBT RETIREMENT 0,00
372 DERT SERVICE 0.90
000 0.00 0,00 0.00 0,00 .00
SECTION 5: THAT THERE BE APPROPRIATED FROM THE MEDICAL
BENEFITS FUND THE FOLLOWING AMOUNTS:
31000-31958 52000-52985 3300053099 S6000-36539 FH00-F7993
casT PRISONAL CFERATIONS CAPITAL DEBT TRANSFERS & TOTAL
FUNT CNTR. - TEPARTMENT SERVICIS . OUTLAY SERVICE REFUNDE ATPROFRIATIONS
620 MERICAL BENEFITS FUNR
840  TNSURANCE 500,000.00 500,000,00
500,000.00 .00 0.00 .00 0.00 500,000.00
SECTICN 10: THAT THERR BE APPROPRIATED FROM THE RETIREES' ACCRUED
BENEFITS FUND THE FOLLOWING AMOUNTS:
5100051559 30054999 3300053999 S6000:50999 5700057559
cosT TERSONAL CPERATIONS CAFITAL DEET TRANSFERS & TOTAL
FOMND CNTR DEPARTMENT SERVICES GUTLAY SERVICE REFUNDS ATPROPRIATIONS
"
651 RETIREES' ACGCRUED BENEFITS FUND
650  RETIREES 50,000,020 $0,000.00
50,000,00 0.00 0,00 0.00 0.00 50,000,00
4,654218.00  1,679,206.50 £,757.5388.00 7175741 4.400,500.00 17,564,169,91
SECTICHN 11: 1t is found and dotormined that 2il formal setions of this Council comceming
and relating to the adoption of thix Ordinance were adopted in an open meeting of this Council,
and that al] deliborations of this Courcil and of any of #ts committess that resulted i sueh formal
action wor in mectings open 1 the public in caapliance with a1l jegal includi
Section 121,22 of the Ohio Revised Code.
SECTION 12: This Ordinanca is hevehy declared to be an emergeney imeasure necessacy for
ths imemediate preservation of tho public pencs, health, and safety, Such necessiy oxists by msason
uf the fhct that fimds soust be mede aveilable ood be appropriated t provids for the oument expenses
and payments thereof for the first hree months of the fiscal year ending Marck 21, 2018,
Therefore, this Ordinance shell ke sffect and b in foree Fom ynd nfter it passnge and
approval by the Mayar.
PASSED
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL
ATTEST APPRGVED
MAYOR
DATE
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CITY OF BROOK PARK, OHIO B/C

ORDINANCE NoO: _JIlfi- 20077

INTRODUCED BY: MAYOR COYNE

AN ORDINANCE
AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO ENTER INTO AN AGREEMENT WITH
GREATER CLEVELAND AUTO AUCTION, PUBLIC AUCTIONEERS,
FOR THE PURPOSE OF DISPOSING OF AN OBSOLETE CITY VEHICLES
AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS, Greater Cleveland Autce Auction will provide the
City of Brook Park with Auction services for the disposal of
obsolete city wvehicles; and

WHEREAS, Greater Cleveland Auto RAuction will charge the City
of Brook Park a selling fee of $75.00 per auctioned wvehicle; and

WHEREAS, it is in the best interest of the City of Brook
Park that said agreement be entered into;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED, by the Council of the City of
Brock Park, State of Chic, that:

SECTION 1: The Mayor is hereby authorized and directed to
enter into an agreement with Greater Cleveland Auto Auction, for
the purpose of disposing of an obsolete city vehicles a list of
which is attached hereto and incorpcrated herein as Exhibit “A” at
a public sale.

SECTION 2: The money needed for the aforesaild transaction
shall be paid from the Capital Improvement Fund 401, theretofore
appropriated for said purpose.

SECTION 3: It is found and determined that all formal actions
of this Council concerning and relating to the adoption of this
Ordinance were adopted in an cpen meeting of this Council, and that
a1l deliberations of this Council and of any of its committees that
resulted in such formal action were in meetings copen to the public
in compliance with 21l legal reguirements, including Section 121.22
of the OChic Revisged Cecde.




SECTION 4: This Ordinance is hereby declared to be an emergency
measure immediately necessary for the preservation of the public
peace, health, safety and welfare of said City, and for the further
reason to provide for an agreement between Greater Cleveland Auto
Auction and the City of Brook Park; therefore provided this
ordinance receives the affirmative vote of at least five (5)
members elected to Council, it shall take effect and be in force
immediately upon its passage and approval by the Mayor; otherwise,
from and after the earliest period allowed by law.

PASSED:

PRESIDENT OF CCUNCIL

ATTEST : APPROVED:
Clerk of Council MAYOR

DATE




2005
20086
2006
2006
2005
2005

Ford
Ford
Ford
Ford
Ferd
Ford

Taurus
Taurus
Taurus
Taurus
Taurus
Taurus

EXHIBIT A

1FrAFP53235A202208
IFAFP34306RA146648
1FAFPL3276A146646
1FAFP53276R146647
LFAFP53225R202204
1FAFPDL3225A202202




CITY OF BROOK PAREK, OHIO

ORDINANCE No: M/}~ Joi 7

INTRODUCED BY: MAYOR COYNE

AN ORDINANCE
AUTHORIZING B & BF CONSTRUCTION TO COMPLETE
SANITARY SEWER REPATRS NEAR 21718 FORESTVIEW CIRCLE
AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS, the existing 127 sanitary sewer in the public
right-of-way near 21718 Forestview Circie has been compromised and
is in need of repaix;

WHEREAS, proposals to complete the werk were requested from
eight contractors and the results are included as Attachment “A”;

WHEREAS, Council desires to have the work completed;

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of
Brook Park, State of Chio, that:

SECTION 1: Mayor is authorized to pay B and BF Construction
for the repair work as described in Attachment “B”, an estimated
fee of $1%,600.00 {81,000.00 contingency included).

SECTION 2: The money needed tc complete the aforesaid
transaction shall be paild from the Capital Improvement Fund No. 401
theretofore appropriated or to be appropriated for said purpose.

SECTION 3: It is found and determined that all formal
actions of this Cecuncil concerning and relating to the adcption of
this Ordinance were adopted in an open meeting of this Council, and
that all deliberations of this Council and of any of its committees
that resulted in such formal action were in meetings cpen to the
public in compliance with all legal requirements, including Section
121.22 of the Ohio Revised Code.

SECTION 4: This OCrdinance is hereby declared tc be an
emergency measure immediately necessary for the preservation of the
public peace, health, safety of said City, and for the further

Al




reason that the City desires to complete this work as soon as
possible; provided this ordinance receives the affirmative vote of
at least five (5) members elected to Council, it shall take effect
and be in force immediately upon its passage and approval by the
Mayor; otherwise, from and after the earliest period allowed by

law.

PASSED:

PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL

ATTEST: ' APPROVED:
Clerk of Council MAYOR

DATE




EUTHENIES inc.

CONSULTING ENGINEERS

8235 Mohawk Drive, Cleveland, OH 44136 = www.euthenics-inc.com * Telephone (440) 260-1555 » Facsimile {440) 260-1544

MEMO

TO: Mayor Coyne
FROM: Edward R. Piatak, P.E., Consulting City Engineer
DATE: October 18, 2017

SUBJECT: 21718 Forestview Circle Sanitary Sewer Repair

CC: Service Director Cayet

Mayor Coyne:

As per your request, I've contacted a number of Contractors regarding the repairs needed on the
existing sanitary sewer near 21718 Forestview Circle. See below for the responses that I have received
as of the date of this Memo:

B. + B. E. Construction $18,600.00
H and ] Construction $22,142 .50
Fabrizi Trucking and Paving $24,826.00
Xtreme Excavating No Bid
Terrace Construction No Bid
DiGioia-Suburban Excavating No Bid
Mosko Excavating No Bid
Strongsville Excavating No Bid

Please let me know how you like to proceed with having this work completed.

EUTHENICS, INC.

ot T o,

Edward R. Piatak, P.E.
Consulting City Engineer

i\ Jobs\ 187\ Misc-Photos\ 21718 Forestview - Sinkhole\ Documents’\ ForestviewSewerRepair-Ord.docx

Attachment “A”

OFFICERS

R.5. WASQSKY, PE, I'S, CEO, » A. R PIATAK, PE, PRESIDENT » D. T. BENDER, PE, SECRETARY = . L. NEVILLE, PE, TREASURER » E. R. FIATAK, IE, VICE PRESIDENT
ASSOCIATES

R. A BENDER, PE » M, E. KEIMBERLIN, PE, FS = M. M. FILAT, PE = M. R, COSGRIFF, FPE = L. A, BAKER, FE = A, . MALINAK, PE = 8. A, FIORAI, S




Proposal to replace 8 VCP sanitary sewer at 21718 Forestview Circle in the City of Brook Park.

- Pavement restoration shall include replacement of 8”7 — ODOT 451 Reinforced Concrete Pavement (and
curbing) and any damaged sidewalk.

- Trench backfill shall be ODOT 304 (limesténe) and paving shall be in accordance with Cuyahoga
County Standard Construction Drawing MD-3C (10/08/15).

- A copy of the Brook Park Service Department sewer video can be provided upon request.
- Be advised that the City expects work to begin immediately upon authorization.

Inclusions:
- Mobilization o
- Pavement saw cutting I
- Excavation
- Traffic control
- Disposal of materials
- 8”PVC SDR 35 conduit
- Femnco couplings
- Backfill
- 8”Pavement and 4” Sidewalk repairs
- Edge sealing
- Topsoil, seeding and mulching
- Ete...

Exclusions:
- Bond
- Permits
- Inspection Fees
- Sales Tax
- Video Taping
- Construction Staking G ' ey

Attachment “B”

F:\Tobs\187\Misc-Photos\21718 Forestview - Stnkhole\Documents\ForestviewSewerRepair-Ord.docx
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CITY OF BROOK PARK, OHIO 3rd B 7

BIC.

RESOLUTION NO. _ 2§20/

INTRODUCED BY: COUNCILMAN TROYER, COUNCILMAN MENCINI, and
COUNCILWOMAN POWERS, fotuncic. PEES IDEITASTEE G

A RESOLUTION
DESIGNATING THE MONTH OF OCTOBER
AS BREAST CANCER AWARENESS MONTH IN
THE CITY OF BROOK PARK, OCHIO,
AND DECLARTNG AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS, breast cancer is the most common cancer in women
in the United States and second leading cause of death in women;
and

WHEREAS, the City of Brook Park hereby designates the month
of October each year as Breast Cancer Awareness Month in the
City of Brook Park; and

WHEREAS, the City along with Southwest General Health
Center is reminding and urging women to schedule a mammogram
screening; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Council of the City
of Brook Park, State of Ohioc that:

SECTION 1: Council-will discuss at a caucus meeting in June
of each year on how they want to show tTheilr support for bringing
awareness to Breast Cancer during the month of October.

SECTICN 2: That this Council does hereby designate the
month of October each year as Breast Cancer Awareness Month in
Brook Park and will show our support in lighting up our gazebo
with pink lights.

SECTION 3: It is found and determined that all formal
actions of this Council «concerning and relating to this
Rescluticn were adopted in an open meeting of this Council, and
that all deliberations of this Council and of any of its
committees that resulted in such formal actions were in meetings
open to the public in compliance with all legal requirements,
including Sectiocn 121.22 of the Ohio Revised Code.




SECTION 4: This Resolution is hereby declared to be an
emergency measure immediately necessary for the preservation of
the public peace, health, safety and welfare of said City and to
show support provided that this Rescluticon receives the
affirmative vote of at least five (5) members elected to
Council, it shall take effect and be in force immediately upon
its passage and approval by the Mayor; otherwise, from and after
the earliest period allowed by law.

PASSED:
‘ PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL
ATTEST: APPROVED:
CLEREK OF COUNCIL MAYOR
DATE

| HEREBY APPROVE THE WITHIN
INSTRUMENT AS TO LEGAL FORM

BN

e .
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' ﬁ CTOR OF LAW™
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CITY OF BRCOK PARK, OHIO

RESOLUTION NO. @ ﬁ-ZﬁZ'Z

INTRODUCED BY: MAYOR COYNE

A RESOLUTION
RECOGNIZING PROJECT EVERGREEN’S GREENCARE AND SNOWCARE FOR
TROOPS INITIATIVE AS THE PREFERRED PROVIDER FOR FAMILIES OF
DEPLOYED MILITARY PERSONNEL, AND POST 9/11 DISABLED VETERANS
WITH A SERVICE-CONNECTED DISABILITY IN THE CITY OF BROOK PARK
AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS, cur deployed military members families and thosé
with post 9/11 service-connected disazbilities struggle to care
for their lawns and or removel of snow and ice; and’

WHEREAS, the City of Brock Park hereby recognizes Project
Evergreen’s GreesnCare and SnowCare for Troops Initiative as the
preferred provider; and

WHEREAS, the city alcng with Project Evergreen’s GreenCare
and SnowCare for Troops Initiatives is reminding and urging
families of deployed military personnel and post 9/11 disabled
veterans with service-connected disabilities to sign up for
assistance, and ’

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Council of the City
of Brook Park, State of Chio that:

SECTION 1: That this Council dces hereby recognize PROJECT
EVERGREEN’S GREENCARE AND SNOWCARE FCR TROOPS INITIATIVE as The
Preferred Provider For Families Of Deployed Military Personnel,
And Post 9/11 Disabled Veterans With A Service-Connected
Disability.

SECTION 2: It is found and determined that all formal
actiocns of this Council concerning and relating to this
resclution were adopted in an open meeting of this Council, and
that all deliberations of this Council and any of its committees
that resulted in such formal actions were in meetings open to
the public in compliance with all legal requirements, including
section 121.00 of the Chic Revised Code.




SECTION 3: This Rescolution is hereby declared to be and
emergency measure immediately necessary for the preservation of
the public peace, health, safety and welfare of the said City
and to show suppcrt provided that this Resclution recelves the
affirmative vote of at least five (5) members elected to
Council, it shall take effect and be in force immediately upon
its passage and approval by the Mayor; ctherwise, from and after
the earliest period allowed by law.

PASSED:
PRESIDENT OF CQCUNCIL
ATTEST: APPROVED:
CLERK OF COUNCIL MAYOR
{ HEREBY AFPROVE YHE WITHIN %o
INSTRUMEN EORM .

RREGTNESS:
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CITY OF BROOK PARK, OHIO e

RESOLUTION NO. __ 3fl- Zp}~)

INTRODUCED BY: COUNCIIMAN TROYER

A RESOLUTION
HONORING ASTRONAUT AND SENATOR, JOHN GLENN,
AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS, Senztor John Glenn was a distinguished fighter pilot
in both World War II and Korea, with six Distinguished Flying
Crosses and 18 clusters to the Air Medal; and

WHEREAS, Senator John Glenn was the first American to orbit
the Earth when he when he piloted “Friendship 77 around the globe
three times in 1962; and

WHEREAS, ZAmerican’s young and old are deeply 1ndebted for
Senator Glenn’s passion for exploration and for his many military
and public-service accomplishments; and

WHEREAS, Glenn resigned from NASA in 1264, and was elected to
the U.S. Senate in 1974, representing Ohio for 25 years; and

WHEREAS, Upon John Glenn’s retirement from the United States
Senate and return from space, John and his wife Annie Glenn founded
the John Glenn Institute for Public Service at the Ohio State
University. Through its programs, they sought to improve the
guality of public service and to encourage young-peocople to pursue
careers in government;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the Council of the City of
Brook Park, State of Ohio that:

SECTION 1: The Mayor and Council will miss our outer space
explorer, NASA Astronaut, American aviator and engineer, forever a
hero, United States Senator John Gienn for his love of life, his
commitment to public service and his desire to make the world a
better place.




L

SECTION 2: The Clerk of Council is hereby directed to forward
a certified copy of this Resolution to NASA and the United States
Senate.

SECTION 3: Tt is found and determined that all formal actions
of this Council concerning and relating to this Resolution were
adepted in an open meeting of this Council, and that all
deliberations of this Council and of any of its committees that
resulted in such formal actions were in meetings open to the public
in compliance with all legal requirements, including Section 121.22
of the Chio Revised Code.

SECTION 4: This Resolution is hereby declared to be an
emergency measure immediately necessary for the preservation of the
public peace, health, safety and welfare of said City, and for
honoring Senator John Glenn for his many years. of space
explioration, wmilitary and public service accomplishments;
therefore, this Resolution shall take effect and be in Fforce
immediately from and after its passage and approval by the Mayor.

PASSED:
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL
ATTEST: APPROVED:
Clerk of Council MAYOR
| HEREBY ARPPROVE THE WITHIN DATE

INSTRUMENT AS-TG-EEGA}. FORM

AND.GORRECTNESS
(=157 =

DIRECTOR OF CAW .

B SRS W} L
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ORDINANCE No: /f/C07-.20)7) 3rdR

B/IC

INTRODUCED BY: MAYOR COINE

AN ORDINANCE
REQUESTING CERTIFICATION TO ENFORCE THE 2017
OHIO STATE BUILDING CODES WITHIN THE
CITY OF BROOK PARK,
AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY -

WHEREAS, the City of Brook Park, Ohioc desires to enforce the
Chio State Building Codes for the purpose of providing uniform
standards and requirements for the erection, construction, repair,
alteration, and maintenance of buildings; and

WHEREAS, the City cf Brook Park, Ohioc seeks to obtain the
authecrity for enforcement of the provisions of the Ohio State
Building Codes through certification by the Chic Boaxd of Building
Standards pursuant to Section 731.231, of the Ohio Revised Code;

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED, by the Council of the City of
Brock Park, State of Ohio, that:

SECTION 1: That the 2017 Ohio Building Code, 2017 Ohic
Plumbing Code, 2017 Ohio Mechanical Code, 2017 National Electric
Code, and the 2012 International Energy Code as promulgated by the
Ohic Board of Building Standards shall apply and be enforced within
the City of Brook Park.

SECTION 2: That this Ordinance shall be in full force and
effect from and after the eariiest period permitted by law by the
Board of Building Standards, through the certification process,
adopting and effective date of certification issued by the Chio
Board of Building Standards.

SECTION 3: The Mayor of the City of Brook Park is hereby
authorized and directed te sign and submit an zpplication to the
Chio Board of Building Standards regquesting said Board to cextify
the City of Brock Park for enforcement of the above mentioned codes
of Chio.

SECTION 4: It is found and determined that all formal actions
of this Council concerning and relating to the adoption of this
Ordinance were adcopted in an open meeting of this Council, and that
gll deliberaticns of this Ccuncil and of any of its committees that
resulted in such formal action were in meeting open tc the public,
in compliance with all legal requirements, including Section 121.22
of the Chic Revised Code.




SECTION 5: This Ordinance is hereby declared to be an
emergency measure immediately necessary for the preservation of the
public peace, health, safety and welfare of said City, and for the
further reason to adopt the 2017 the Ohio Building Code, OChio
Plumbing Code, Chioc Mechanical Code, National Electric Code, and
the 2012 Internaticnal FKEnergy Code; therefore, provided this
ordinance receives the affirmative vote of at least five (5)
members elected to Council, it shall take effect and be in force
immediately upcn its passage and approval by the Mayor; otherwise,
from and after the earliest period allowed by law.
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